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O ne Upward Look Each Day. 

Every day is a fresh beginning, 

Every morn a world made new, 

You who are weary of sorrow and sinning 

Here is a beautiful hope for you, 

A ho pe for me and a hope for you. 

All the past things are past and over, 

The tasks are done and the tears are 

shed, 

Yesterday's error let yesterday cover; 
Yesterday's wounds, which smarted and 

bled, 
Are healed with the 

night has shed. 

healing which 

Let them go, since we cannot relieve them 

life testifiy for the Master. Never 
be ashamed of Him, and let your 
example be such that others may 
see Christ reflected in your every 
word and action. ”’ 

Philip did not forget the words 
of his pastor when he went down to 
thelittle manufacturing town of Bed 

ford, to enter upon his duties as 
book-keeper in one of its most im- 
portant factories. He took Jesus 
with him right into the counting- 

room, but he found it harder work 
than be had expected to display his 
colors in a place where everybody 

seemed to be marching under a dif- 

Cannot undo and cannot atone; 

God in his merey forgive them and blot 

them, 

Only the new days are our own, 

To-day is ours and ours alone. 

Every day is a fresh beginoing, 

Listen my soul to the glad refrain, 

And spite of old sorrow and oldersinning, 

And puzzles forecasted and possible 

pain, 

“Take heart with the day and begig 

again. 

“Ye Are My Witnesses, ” 
—— 

“Trust you will be an earnest 

witness for the Master in your new 

field of labor, ” said Dr. Robertson, 

the morning his young parishioner, 

Philip Lawrence, came to bid him 

good-by. 
“T hope I shall not deny Him, 

at least, ” replied the young man, 

seriously. 
“That determination may com- 

prehend a great deal more than you 
think. Standing up for Jesusin a 
community where there are no 
churches and where the Sabbath is 
kept only as a holiday, is very dif- 
ferent from following in His steps 

in a city where religion is popular 

and its professors are highly esteem- 
ed. © Mere silent witnessing for 
Christ may prove a much greater 

sacrifice than you at present imagine. 

Lot me tell you a little story con- 

nected with my own early life and 
conversion. 

“ Just after I left college, more 

than forty years ago, I went to a 

mining town in the far West to en- 

gage in teaching. It was a wild, 
wicked place, and although I had 
been carefully trained in a Christian 

home, I soon fell in with the mode 

of life as I found it there. Though 

the town was small, drinking swear 

ing and fighting were common, and 
work was carried on during Sunday 

just as on the other days of the 
week. 

« After I had been there nearly 

a year, a stranger who seemed to 

have plenty of money bought a lot 

in the centre of the town for the 

purpose of erecting a large woolen 

factory. He had all his stones 

dressed, and his timbers in readi- 

ness before beginning to build, and 

the number of men he put to work 

on the Monday morning of his 

arrival convinced the villiagers that 

he meant business. During the week 

the structure rose like magic; but 

when Sunday came not a single 
workman made his appearance. 

Labor. went on in other places as 
usual, but here everything was 

strangely silent. People on the 

streets stopped to inquire what was 

wrong, but no one could explain 

why the workmen were idle, until 

one bolder than the rest ventured 

into the presence of the proprietor 

to inquire into the trouble. ‘Noth- 

ing is wiong,’ replied the stranger 

pleasantly, when the man had made 

know his errand. ‘This is Sunday, 

you know, and I neither work nor 

allow my men to work upon that 

day.’ 
“The new-comer’s peculiar views 

were freely discussed that afternoon 
among his neighbors. Some thought 

he was not altogether sane, and 
others expressed the opinion that he 
was entirely too conscientious to 

live in a mining town where people 

were obliged to work for their living; 
but all agreed that sooner or later 
he would be glad to conform to the 
custom of the place as others had 
done. But they were mistaken. 
The work on the building went on 
with increasing rapidity during the 
weeks that followed, but when the 
Sabbath came the sound of the 
hammer and axe was stilled, and the 
great unfinished structure stood 
there alone in that wicked place a 
gilent witness for the Master. I 
tel! yon, Philip, that mute building 
appealed to wy conscience as no 
other testimony could have done. 
Others—wanderes from godly homes 
felt the same silent influence, and 
in the course of a few months a 
great reformation was wrought 

through the aid of that dumb 
preacher, which had testified sofaith- 

fully for the sanctity of the Sabbath. 
Afterwards a church was organized, 

and an earnest preacher came 

among us, with the open Bible in 

his haad and the love of God in his 

heart, and—well, if it had not been 

for r1y year in that mining town, I 

wight still Le a stranger to Jesus, 

for it was that blessed man that led 
me to Christ, I tell you this story 
to show you the power of even a 

gilent witness for Christ, I do not 

“mean, of course, that you are to be- 

gin a large building to gain this in- 

ferent captain. It was a new but 

rapidly growing village, without 

churches or Sunday-schools, and 

though work was suspended on the 
Sabbath, the day was observed mere 
ly as a holiday Philip's genial 

nature soon made him a general 

favorite among the men in the fac- 

tory, and before he had filled the 

position a month he had many in- 

vitations to join them in their Sun- 
day sports. He had the courage of 
bis convictions, however, and in a 

quiet but very determined way in- 

formed them that he could not con 

scientiously desecrate the Lord's 

day. They laughed at his scruples 
a little at first, yet they could not 
help admiring the spirit he showed, 
and more than one among the num- 

ber felt the silent rebuke thus ad- 

ministered day after day more than 
they were willing to confess. Two 
or three of them said as much to 
him, and acknowledged that they 
had lived very differently when at 
home. 

Philip was only a young disciple 
himself, and had always been a fol- 
lower rather than a leader, yet he 
was very much in earnest, and after 
praying a great deal over the mat- 
ter, he invited two or three of the 

young men to come to his room on 

a certain night to talk over their 

hopes and prospects for the future. 
He was surprised to learn that two 
of the number, Dick Holmes and 
George Lee, had been professors of 
religion at home, but that they had 
not been strong enough to stand up 
for their convictions among the 

reckless people with whom they had 
cast their lots. They were tired of 

the life that they had been living of 
late years, and eagerly expressed 
their desire to return to their allegi- 
ance to their fathers’ God. Before 
they separated they agreed to meet 
together on Sundays for the purpose 
of studying their Bibles and pray: 
ing for themselves and their com- 
paniors. 

After a few meetings they suc- 
ceeded in persuading two or three 
other young men to join them, and 
when the number reached a dozen, 
Philip suggested the organization 
of an Epworth League. At first 
they met in the school-house, and 
the burden of the serving fell to 
Philip's share; but as the interests 
deepened, others willingly took their 
share, aud before the winter was 
over the school-house had to be ex- 
changed for a larger building. Im- 
mediately after the Week of Prayer 
a quiet revival began, and though 
there was no excitement connected 
with it, the meetings grew in interest 
until every heart in the village was 
touched. Ministers from the neigh. 
boring towns very willingly tender- 
ed their assistances, and Dr. Robert- 
son, frow the city, came down to 
bid them God-speed and catch a 
breath of inspiration. Before the 
services closed, a church was organ- 
ized in the place, with a promising 
Sunday-school in connection, and 
more hearts than Philip Lawrence's 
beat high with hope and gratitude 
when they counted the number of 
souls that had been born into the 
kingdom through the influence of 
that League which at first number- 
ed only twelve. 
“You have been bearing more 

than silent influence for your Master, 
my friend, ” said Dr. Robertson, as 
he grasped Philip’s hand the night 
of the farewell meeting. “ What a 
glorious privilege it is to be an in- 
stroment in God’s hand in bringing 
souls to Christ |” 

“T am beginning to catch a 
glimpse of the responsibility of liv- 
ing ” answered Philip. 

“If I have borne even the least 
witness for Jesus, it has all been 
accomplished through your faithful- 
ness in warning me. I never could 
forget the influence of that silent 
building, witnessing so mutely for 
the truth. The thought that my 
Saviour would accept even the gift 
of dumb serving made me strong to 
resist temptation and helped me to 
try to follow closely in His steps. ” 

“ After all, there is no witness: 
hearing so powerful or convincing 
as that of a Charistly life, ” admitted 
Dec. Robertson. “Blessed is he wlo 
is wise enough to know when to 
speak and when to keep silent!” 
Zions Herald. 
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Two Mothers. 

While making calls one afternoon 
I stopped at the houses of two old 
friends of mine, both of whom re- 
joiced in the possession of a bright 
little girl. The difference in the 
management displayed by the two 
mothers taught me a lesson which I 

fluence, but you must let your daily 

The friend on whom I first called 
was Mrs. Johnson. Being on ve 
intimate terms with her, I walked 
unceremoniously into the sitting- 
room, where I found her busily sew- 
ing. 

“ Keep right on with your work,” 
I said, as I saw she intended laying 
it down; “ we can talk just as well 
while you sew. ” 
We might have had an hour's 

pleasant chat but for the annoyance 
caused by little E sie, a child of four 
summers. She had been playing 
around the room, amusing herself 
with a doll and an old picture-book. 
But very soon she grew tired of 
these, and having nothing else on 
hand, she began to bother her 
mother. The little thirg was tired 
out, and this made her cross, as 
fatigue sometimes does children of 
a larger growth. She kept pulling 
and dragging at her mother’s dress, 
and when sharply commanded to 
“go away, ” would retire to another 
part of the room, only to return 
shortly and continue the attack. All 
this time she kept up a whining, 
which was disagreeable in the ex- 
treme. 1 tried to persuade her to 
come to me, but she merely gave me 
a scorneful glance and persisted in 
annoying her mother. Of course it 
was impossible for us to hold a con- 
versation. Finally Mrs. Johnson 
became 80 exasperated that she 
tock hold of the child and administ- 
ered a sound whipping. This did 
not improve matters, for Elsie set 
up such a loud and protracted howl 
that I was glad to take my depart- 
ure. 
Then I wended my way to Mrs. 

Seymours, I found my friend en- 
gaged in tiimming a bonnet, and I 
begged her to go right on, as I had 
done in the other case. ‘Little May 
of three and a half years, was try- 
ing to make a hat for her dull. She 
busied herselt in this way for some 
time, and at last, becoming discour- 
aged with her efforts, began to show 
symptoms of fretfulness. 
“Must I endure it again?’ 1 

asked myself. But no, the mother’s 
ready tact came to the child's as 
well as to my relief. Casting her 
eye around the room in search of 
some new amusement for her little 
girl, she espied an old bandbox that 
was of no further use as a hat- 
receiver. 
“Wait till you see what I'm going 

to make for you,” she said sosthing- 
ly, and taking the old box, in a very 
few minutes she had cut windows 
and doors in it and made a chimney 
for the top ; in fact had turmed it 
into a little house, which quite de- 
lighted Miss May. With this the 
child played quietly for an hour, 
and it was only when | was start- 
ing to go, after a pleasart chat with 
Mrs. Seymour, that she seemed to 
be getting tired of it. The works 
of an old clock were then brought 
out of a near closet, and I could see 
that this novel plaything was likely 
to keep May interested for some 
time. “See, I can make the wheels 
go wound!” she said, her eyes 
sparkling like two bright stars. 

In this way the busy mother 
saves herself and her child (not to 
speak of ner visitors) much annoy- 
ance and misery ; and the few mo 
ments spent in concocting little sur- 
prises and entertainments gives her 
hours for her work that she could 
not otherwise command.—S. Jennie 
Smith. 
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Family Policemanship. 

There are some households that 
are prevaded with a religion of 
“Stop that !” or “There, now, don’t!” 
or ‘“ If you do that, I'll whip you !” 
The children in these households 
continually experience a sense of 
being under arrest, or an apprehen- 
sion that they may, at any moment, 
be arrested. The principal relation 
they sustain to their parents is that 
of violators of the law. The ac- 
quaintance they have with these 
parents is much the same as they 
might be expected to have with 
constables or policemen. It was one 
of these parents who stopped the 
festivities at a dinner party from 
which his children were excluded, to 
say to the servant: “Go and see 
what the children are doing, and tell 
them to stop it.” The only objects 
accomplished by such domestic 
policemen and policewomen as these 
are the worrying of their children 
and the complete acidulation of 
their households. Children brought 
up on this continued diet of peevish 
reproof and quarrelsome rebuke 
grow sour and capitous and irritable 
and eventually as disagreeable as 
the parental police who have worried 
them, No child can have a very 
holy admiration for such a patent; 
and if the fifth commandment is 
vbeyed at all by a child so circum- 
staneed, the obedience is compulsory 
and perfunctory rather than hearty 
and spontaneous. A child is a price- 
less gift from God, not only to be 
trained, but to be loved and enjoy- 
ed ; not to be treated only as an 
object of discipline, but to be wade 
a friend and companion. There are 
many people who would look with 
horror on the worrying of un dog or 
the teasing of a cat, but who habit- 
ually inflict on their childrea worry 

shall never forget. 

wish themselves dead or buried. 
These people are objects of terror to 
their children, even as are police. 
It is time to reform. Make the 
reform as thorough as possible, and 
the whole house will be happier for 
it.—Dr. Talmage. 

re tf Ot Qn 

Rest and Unrest. 

Two mothers, each with a young 
baby and no nurse, was discussing 
how they managed it. “I should be 
worn out,” said one, “I'm sure, ex- 
cept for my ress. I wake ita 
point as soon a8 my baby is sound 
asleep for his morning nap to drop 
everything and lie down myself.” 
“Oh,” said the other, “while my 
baby takes his nap 1s \ 2¢ only chance 
I have to gather up the loose ends 
ab ut the house.” 

In these two phases of manage- 
ment lies a wide and deep philoso 
phy. Ten years from now it will 
be safe to predict that that second 
mother will have jines on her face 
and wrinkles on her brow that have 
no business to be there, and, equally, 
that mother No. 1 will still be 
fresh and blooming. 
Woman are bezinning to under- 

stand that it is the continuous, un- 
relieved strain that tells;it is doubt 
ful if many of them, particularly the 
busy workers, fully appreciate that 
it lies within their own reach to 
modify this condition. “I never 
stand when I can sit, and I never 
sit ‘when I can lie down,” said a 
woman who had discovered the 
value of brief respites, and ber 
sisters, if they try, may similarly 
find innumerable opportunities, now 
overlooked, to ease the strain of 
their daily occupations if ever so 
briefly. Most women stand before 
their dressing bureaus to do their 
hair—an unnecessary waste of 
strength. Even’if the daily coiffure 
is a very simple one—taking a brief 
time to accomplish—those few mo- 
ments will amount in the end to a 
goodly sum of rest.— New York 
Tribune. 
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It Makes All Wrong. 

“Please, father, is it wrong 
pleasuring on the Lord's day? 
teacher says it is.” 
“Why, child, perhaps it is not 

exactly right.” 
“Then it is wrong, 

father 7” 
“0, I don’t know that—if it is 

once in a while.” 
“Father, you know how fond I 

am of sums ?” 
“Yes, John, 1 am glad you are; I 

want you to do them well, and be 
quick and clever at figures. But 
why do you talk of sums just now?” 

“Because, father, if there is one 
little figure put wrong in the sum 
it makes all wrong, however large 
the amount is.” 

“To be sure, child, it does.” 
“Then, please, father, don’t you 

think that if God’s day is put wrong 
now and then it makes all wrong 1’ 

“ Put wrong, child, how?” 
“l mean, father, put to a wrong 

use.” 
“That brings it very close,” said 

the father, as if speaking to him- 
self, and then added : “John it is 
wrong to break God’s holy Sabbath. 
He has forbidden it, and your 
teacher was quite right.” 

“ Remember the Sabbath day to 
keep 1t holy.— Kind Words. 
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He Berievep IN Luck.—Mr. 
Lloyd Bryce, in the North American 
Review, tells a characteristic story 
of Peter Cooper: 

“Mr. Cooper,” said Mr. Bryce, 
“is there such a thing as luck?” 

“There is. The greatest piece of 
luck I ever had was investing the 
first surplus money I earned in a 
lottery ticket.” 
“And you won?’ 
“No, 1 lost; but I gained this 

experience ; that the wheel of for- 
tune is only turned by common sense 
applied in common events,” 
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Minard's Liniment 
Diphtheria. 

Lapies go into ecstacies over the 
new perfume, ‘‘Lotus of the Nile.” 

cures 

TWELVE YEARS’ TEST. 

Dear Siks,— We have used Hag- 
yard’s Yellow Oil in our family for 
twelve years and find nothing to equal 
it for rheumatism, lumbago, lame back, 
frost bites, etc. We would not be 
without it, 

Megs. MaTiLpa CHICK, 
Winnipeg, Man. 

——————————————— 

PERFECT PURITY. 

Perfect purity of the blood is essen- 
tial to good health. Bardock Blood 
Bitters will parify the blood and re- 
move all effete matter. B. B. B. 
cures all blood diseases from a common 
pimple to the worst scrofulous sore. 

Not one in twenty are free from 
some little ailments caused by inaction 
of the liver. Use Carter's Little Liver 
Pills. The result will be a pleasant 
surprise. They give positive relief, 

The public should bear in wind that 
Dr. Thomas’ Eclectric Oil has nothing 
in common with the impure, deterior- 
aing class of so-called medicinal oils. 1t 
is eminently pure and really efficacious 
~relieving pain and lameness, stiffness 
uf the joints and muscles, and sores or 

“German Lawn Tennis! 
‘Racquets! Balls! Nets! Croquet ! da Bey: : 

ru Fishing Outfits! 

Oiled Silk and Silk Lines for Salmon 

G. Gloger, Druggist, Watertown, land Trout ; Flies—best home make ; 

Wis. This is the opinion of a man Hooks of all kinds; Gut; Casting 

who keeps a drug store, sells all Lines ; Reels; Bait Boxes ; Fly Books; 

medicines, comes in direct contact| LAnCIDR Nets ; Bamboo P
oles ; Good 

with the patients and their families, | 

Base Ball Coods, and knows better than anyone else 

how remedies sell, and what true 

merit they have. He hears of all Bats, Balls, Masks, Belts, Gloves, 

the failures and successes, and can Hammocks. 

therefore #9 e: “I know of no! All of which will be sold low to close 

0 medicine for hs, Sore Throat, [out stock. 

or Hoarseness that had done such ef- ALL'S E00K & NEWS STORE 
fective work in my! ¢ 

Coughs, family as Boschee’s FREDERICTON. 

German Syrup. Last, - 
Sore Throat, Liter a lady called B ELYEA HOTEL 
Hoarseness, at my store, who was 

suffering from a acid 

severe cold. She could hardly talk, 

and I told her about German syrup Saint John, NN. B. 
and that a few doses would give re-| 0 

lief; but she had no confidence in|JAS. L. BELYEA, Proprietor, 
patent medicines. I told her to take, 
a bottle, and if the results were not| oNE MINUTE'S WALK FROM STEAMBOAT 
satisfactory I would make no charge LANDING, 

for it. A few days after she called 47 Street Cars for avd from all Railwa 
and paid for it, saying that she Stations and Steamboat Landings pass this 

would never be without it in future as Hotel every five minutes, 
J. lief’' @ Permanent and Transient Boarders Ac- a few doses had given herrelief.”’ ® Bis yr gg Phrispromacs -. og 

NEW FALL and WINTER 

DRESS GOODS, &c. 
PUY) FI —— 

Tennant. DaviesZ Co 
0 

We are now showing a fine assortment of new DRESS MATERIALS 
in the latest styles and colorings. =A splendid variety of 

BLACK DRESS GOODS, 
IN PLAIN, STRIPES and FANCIES—quite new. 

LADIES’ JACKETS and ULITERS, 

JACKET CLOTHS AND ULSTERINGS. 

253, 255 and 257 Prince William St., 

—) 

TENNANT, DAVIES & CO, 
202 Queen Street, Fredericton. 

SEPTEMBER 22nd. 

DAILY OPENINGS 
OF 

FALL GOODS 
AT 

JOHN J. WEDDALL'S. 
231 Life Assurance Company 3 
HEAD OFFICE--MONTREAL. 
The rapid progress made by this Company may be seen from the following 

Statement : 
INCOME, ASSETS. Lire ASSURANCE 

IN FORCE. 
vs SPSRRTRNG RRR: © 1 Malla eee $646,461.95. .........8$1,076,350.00 
RE... ehh Ed RSARGEA 621,362.81.......... 1,864,302.00 
PR ii DRI os crises TID DAEE. ..... vere 2,214,093.43 
RRR ey Lf SOONER pth NSE 3,374,683.14 
Va TIA SRE saad eh REA 3,881,478.09 
SS 564i ns CNL Cee LIRR. oil 5,849,.889.1 
i SESE Tp BIRR. oasis LTO. 08. ........s 6,844,404.04 
SE. oh sais bak CURA SEER LL O0NES. ... 0... 7,080,878 77 
Bs hs a oe NTE RE LORNA... . 9,413,368 07 
ESR 495,831.64.......... 1,760,004 48. ..... ....10,878,777.09 
RARE ER MD NTAES. ..... 5 ROIRRL. .. Lei 11,931,300.6 
(100 Tg eRe Ry SEAR SRR INR YE... ui .17,164,383.08 
{TERRIER SOREN. Ci, a, SPL IAIN. 20,698,689. 92 

00 

[0 SUN issues Absolately Unconditional Life Policies. 
R. MACAULAY) 

Presipenty MANAGING DIRECTOB. 

J. B. CUNTER, Ceneral Agent. 

16 Prince William St., St. John, and Queen St. Fredericton, N. B 
1 

hurts, besides beiug an excellent speci- 
fic for rheumatism, coughs and bLror- 

enough to make the poor creatures chial complaints, ee ee ee 
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