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Wil the Tories Sac hg 

~The Minister of Militia 
Over Room 16 at Ottawa 

s---Many M. P.’s Sorry They 

4K 

A Deep Gloom Has Been Hanging. 

Since Mr. Kyte Made His Charge 

Did Not Follow the Example of Hon. Mr
. 

Vici ean---Sir Wilfrid's Speech Caught the Galleri
es. 

rs 

(By H. F. Gadsby.) 

Uitawa, April 15.—Certain- 

Iv a deep gloom has been cast 
over this communily. It can 

Y¢ cut with a knife—this Styg- 

ian melancholy. It hangs”like 

a log in the halls and lobbies, 

in Green Chamber ; and Red. 

But it settled thickest in No. 

16, the Conservative caucus 

room. 
tone is the light word, the 

sparking mia fy ay Hugh 

(lark has not told a new story 

for a week—the cheerful ban- 
ter, the merry quip, the-loud 

laugh that speaks the peaceful 

party mind. Gone—all gone. 

Instead, the long face, the bat- 

ed breath, the whispered fear. 
Our old friend, R. E. Morse, is 

in their midst and he looks like 
making a good visit. 

The strikers all came back 
but four. They were glad to 
be pleased with a Royal Com- 
mission that would find out as 
Iftile as possible—any old ex- 
cuse for falling oul of bed and 
falling back again. But now 
they are not so glad. ; 

~The biggest gallery of the 
session greeted Sir Wilfrid's 

speech on bloed-stained graft, 
a zallery more (han half wo- 
men, which shows that the bet- 
ter half of the world is think- 
mg. 
When Sir Wilfrid proclaim- 

ed that the object of all good 
paliriots was to demand an ac- 
count of every dollar drawn 
from the treasury and every 
drop of blood shed on the bal- 
tlefield, the gallery which had 

C 

sons and brothers, husbands 
and sweethear!s on thal dis- 

tant, dangerous field, showed 
signs of deep emotion and the 

sfrikers realized that stop-gap 
measures were not enough. 

They realized that the wid- 
ows. and orphans whose 
moistened the millions so light- 
ly looted by Cel. John Wesley 
Allison and his pals took a dif- 
ferent view "of these things 
from the parly politicians. 

In short they saw that their 
partly zame was a long way be- 
find public senlimentl and they 
would have lo cateh up or be 
left out in the cold at the next 

‘general election. 

Mr. Broder’s Stand. 

They were sore. then, and 
are sore now thal they did not 
zo the limit like (he Ton. An- 
drew Broder, W. F. Maclean, 
Mondou and Lamarche. who 
said by their voles that they 
would rather be righ! than hide 
bound. 
Andy Broder. honesl Andy. 

as heis called. has had a run in 

with Col. John Wesley Allison 
before now, knows «just 

what to expect from this gen- 

tleman with the pions name 
and Lhe predatory instincts. 

Mondou and Lamarche dis- 

tears 

and 

d the ultimate courage of 

their convictions and W. F.| 

Maclean went -the length of 

standing by a week-old editor- 

ial of the Toronto World which ; 

is almost revolutionary in Ww. | 

R's case. 
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i 
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playe 

On the whole No. 16 

wapped in profound regrel| 

that it didn't show up belter 

on division. Nelson's maxim 

was (hat the boldest measures 

are the safest and who are they 

to go behind the ripe wisdom 

of that great leader? If safety 

first is the line .to take, why 

didn't they take it? If Mark 

Twain was prepared to saeri- 
fice all his wife's relations why 
shouldn't the Conservative par- 
ty in the House of Gommons 
be prepared to sacrifice Major 
General Sir Sam Hughes? 

Has he any more right to 
escape complete investigation 

than the Duke of Marlboro who 
was one of the examples cited 
by Sir Wilfrid Laurier? 

The Acting Ministers. 

Sacrifice Sir Sam? Would 
he be the only sacrifice? Aye. 
there's the rub! There's the 
consideration that gives them 
pause. Wouldn't it mean the 
sacrifice of the whole govern- 
ment? 4 
Time was-——and not so long 

ago al that—when the cabinel 
ministers were making free 
use of detectives to hang some- 
thing on each other. How far 
did they succeed? g 

1t is all right for the cabinet 

lo profess colleetive ignorance 

S 

of Sir Sam's doings. bul the | 

fact remains that in the War 
Lord's various absences, Sir 

Robert Borden, Hazen: Kemp, 
and Lougheed served as acting | 

Minister of Militia and must] 

have had a peep into the abyss. ( 
How much did {they see? How 

much did they shut their eyes 
to?  Semuator Lougheed, forin- 

stance, was acling Minister of 

Militia at the very lime the fuse 
handed to 

{he American Ammunition Co. 

and the International Arms and 

BUst How Tittle does he 

know about it? 
Did nobody bul 

Commillee examine 

lracls by which 
290 worth of fuse orders and 

advance payments of over $3. 

000,000 were slipped along lo 

a couple of mushroom com- 
panies in the United States for 
which a professional soldier of 

contracts Gd vere 

Hoh 

the Shell 

the con- 
$23.000,- 

fortune like Allison was the 

agenl and of which a railroad 
wrecker like Benjamin Frank- 
lin Yoakum was feading mem- 

ber? Did nobody bul the shell 
commillee inspect the pledge 

of the Guarantee Trust Com- 
pany of New York for 
two companies. a pledge wilh 
[his “hal 

this company shall not be held 

responsible otherwise for ihe 

[hese 

clause as a joker 

him. 

Soap is. 

“man will bring it to 
your home soon. 

Do not miss this chance to 
find out how big and how good Gold 

This Full Size 
Cake of 

the Big, Good 

Gold Soap Free! 

The Gold Soap 

Watch for 

/ 

Gold Svap is made in Canada in the 'rocter & Gamble Factories 
at Hamilton. 

rifice 

Broder and W. F, 

non-performance of this agree- 
ment due to any cause beyond 
its reasonable control? 
How far does Sir Thomas 

White's contention go that Ma- 
jor General Sir Sam, as shown 

y his rdtifying letters, was 
acting for His Britannic Maj- 

esty in these matters? How 

far, on the other hand,.prevails 
Sir Wilfrid Laurier’'s argument 

that he derived his whole force 
and authority to - ratify con- 
tracts, not as Major General, 
not as Sir Sam Hughes, not as 

both pul together, but as Min- 
ister of Militia for the Domin- 

ion of Canada? 

Such are the thoughts that 

rankle in No. 16 and cause it 
serious intestinal disturbances. 
[L's all very well to sing “Down 
among the dead men 1c! him 

o 

1 
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lie,” but there are a whole lot} 
of live one who will trip'him up 
if he is caught at it. 

This is no song for dropping 
spirits. Some suggest a coali- 
lion government, the idea be- 

ing to present the Grits with a 
share of the blame, bul there is 
no hope in that direclion. 

Others favor the Royal Coin- 
mission on the principle of the 
man who sold a 2.10 horse 
that couldn't do it under 3.10 
and then chided the purchaser 
for being in such a deuce of a 
hurry, that he couldn't wail a 
minute. 

Sir Sam and Allison. 

Jul when all is said and 
done, the talk comes back fo 

Sir Sam Hughes and his soul- 

nate, Col. John Wesley Alli- 

SO1L. last session the War 

Lord's critics were calling him 

Sir Sham Shoes—1his session 
te goes by {lie name of Sir Sam 
“HBO. 

agreed on all sides that 

his friendship with Col. John 

Wesley Allison of the 

greatest, most passionale and 

most expensive allfinilies of 

hisl Nol David and Jona- 

than, nor Orestes and Pylades. 
nor Damon and Pythias. ever 
cost their country mitch 

money. George Kyle has al- 
ready advertised some of the 
gallant charges made by Col. 

John Wesley Allison. with Ma- 
jor General Sam the foree in 

reserve. and there are said lo 
be more where thal came from. 

This naturally keeps No. 16 
guessing. Is Col. John Wesley 
Allison to be the only goal or is 
Sir Sam to go out along wilh 

him into (he wilderness? 

IS one 

v. 

SO 

Moreover. is. Sir Sam satis-; 

fied to have it that way? So 
far any speeches which would 
indicate that Sir Sam is lo be 
the goal have heen framed 

wilh the idea of not letting him 

know aboul il. Any absent 
[realment Sir Sam had 

from his colleagues in the cab- 

inel | heen very delgeate 
hardly hard enough to break an 

Which of course is as il 

no man 
must be convieled before he is 

tried. especially'if he is, too re- 
spectable to be guilty. © On the 
whole, it would suit the cabi- 
nel better to have (he wicked 
Grils dislodge Sir Sam. This 
would avoid hard feelings and 

mutual reeriminations in 
Conservative ranks. 

has 

1s 

An Honorary Colonel. 

Sir Sam has now reached 
his native shores and Col. John 

Wesley Allison has been heard 
from. The Colonel is as near 

Otlawa and the Public A¢- 
counts Committee as Carolina. 
That will probably be the Col- 

orbil until Parliament 

prorogues and the 
mission hegins. 

Lb asall molt Zhe necessary lo 

éxliradite Col, John Weslt \l- 

lison for perjury. [Te is an 
honorary colonel of Sir Sam’ wit 

onel's 
| 

Wo \ 

Lr 5 

the. 

Yoyal Gom- 

rT grea pm © erm tm wort eA a i 

own coinage, made so, as Sir 
Sam h tated, 

colonels are under 

aa } i 
1S 8 pecaiuse hon- 

mili- | orary 

from Ottawa and he does as he 
pleases. This means, of course. 

that, or no orders, he 

will come to Ottawa fo vindi- 
cate his honor, because—well 

because somebody put the 
honor in honorary colonel. 

orders 

Besides, he is not afraid of 

Royal Commissions, having al- 
ready had experience of the 
Davidson where 

three kinds of evidence, all dif- 

ferent, were tendered on that 

little "matter of the Colts re- 

Commission. 

sale to the Canadian Govern- 

ment for $4.50 each more than 

the retail trad ecould buy them 
tors a: lofts of two. 

No shot ever fired by a Royal 
ommission has even hurt Col. 

[i He is brave ling 

{ 

accordingly. 

Bennett is Cheerful. 

The only really cheerful soul 

on the Government side is R. 

B. Bennett of Calgary, who 
played safe in his last speech 
when he hinted at dead repu- 
tations, post mortems and 
things like thal. His idea 

seems lo be that the Govern- 

ment is dissolute enough to call 

for dissolution. As Katisha 
observes in the Mikado, “there 

is fascination frantic in a ruin 

that's romantic. and 1 think I 

am sufficiently decaved.” 

Al the back of R. B.'s speech 
there was probably the reflec- 
tion that the remains have been 

kept too long already. Al all 

evenis nearly all the Conser- 
vative colonels in the House 

have blossomed out once more 

in khako. The intention may | 
be to give the Governmeni af 
wi lary funeral. 

*Weod’s Phosphoding, 
whi The Great English® Remedy. 

Tones and invigorates the whole 
4 BR; Bh nervous system, makes new Blood 
=. in old Veins, Cures Nervous 

Debility, Mental and Brain Worry, Despon- 
dency, Loss of Energy, Palpitation of the 
Heart, Failing Bemory. Price $1 per box, six 
for $5, @ One will please, six will cure g Sold by all 

Sd & Attraction Extraordinary Bas vos : i | x ROSSLEY’S LILLIPUTIAN MUSICAL COMEDY CO. 
Consequently the Colonel can | ; - Eels 28 - Tous of Costumes Chorusiof 20 HA A I RS shee ONIGHTS PLAY - JOCK THE KING’S PIPER 

volvers which were sold whole- | 
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Opera House re W 

ENTIRE CHANGE PROGRAMME DAILY 

TORONTO 
Reopens after East 

TE TT ¥ ma MR, 

For Baby's Bath 
The creamy softening lather of Baby's Own Sozp 

and the fragrance of its delicate aroma leave 
the skin cleansed—refreshed—aromatized 

Four gencraticns of Canadian mothers hare used and 
recommended It. 

In ihe Interest cf your children’s skin incist on Baby's Own Soap 
Abert Soaps, Limited, fra, Montreal 

— N 

druggists or maiied in plain pkg. on receipt of 
| price. New pamphlet mailed free. THE WOOD 
MEDICINE CO., TORONTO, ONT. (Formerly Windsor.) 
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the least money. 

them. 

Why, I never 

“Well now, wl 

[ study my business 

skill and judgemen 

term is-understood 

they visit all the 
then give the work 

17 
\ 
W 
W “The ordinary 

no more a judge of 

people ask me for q 
a little more than 

mighty poor rule th 

Specialist 

Talks To His Son 

visil the different doctors in town, and find out who will cure me tor 

Get your quotalions tabulated and then let me see 
Of course we will engage the doctor who charges the leasi.” 

gelling quotalions f 

it that shouldn't, I have just as much brains as the average doclor. 
strive to give my customers (he benefit of my knowledge, my artistic 

“When some people around here have a little printing to be done, 

of medicine a doclor shouid give him for the cure of his ailment. 

melhod to the doctor, lawyer, dentist and painter? Why nol? 

he MAIL PRINTING CO. 

HE 1 

WW The Print; Public vw The Printing and Publicity 

feel quite sick today,” said bir. Blank. ‘Please 

heard of such a thing,” said John. “The idea of 
rom a doctor; it's the asylum for you.” \ 

I am a specialist in printing ana publicity. 
If I do say 

I 

1y not? 

just as carefully as any doctor can do. 

t and my ideas on publicity. I give service as the 

in the Twentieth Century. 

rinting offices, get quotations from each one, and 

to the man who gives the lowest figures, 

user of printing knows his owil business, but he ic 
the work of printing than he is a judge of what sort 

if 
uotations and pass me by if my price happens to be 
the other fellow, why shouldn't T apply the same 

Biss 

ab won't work more than one way.” 
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