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THE NEW GOVERNOR. 

A despatch from Ottawa announces 

that Hon, Dr. Pugsley, former M.P. 

for St. John, has accepted the appoint- 

ment of Lieutenant-Governor of New 

Brunswick in succession to Hon. G. 

W. Ganong, who died last week. While 

the withdrawal of so able and brilliant 

a parliamentarian from active political 

life at the present time will be a loss 

to Canada, his appointment as chief 

executive will be well received by all 

classes of the people of his native pro- 

vince. Hon. Dr. Pugsley has been in 

public life for more than thirty years, 

and has given splendid services to his 

province and to Canada. He has been 

Speaker of the Legislature, Premier 

and Attorney General of the province, 

and for four years he held the office 

of Minister of ‘Public Works in the 

Federal cabinet. He is one of Canada- 

da’s foremost legal practitioners and 

as a parliamentarian without a 

peer. A man of genial and sympath- 

etic disposition, he thoroughly under- 

stands conditions in New Brunswick 

and can be counted upon to worthily 

is 

uphold the best traditions of the high |7%% 

office to which he has been called. 

Hon. William Pugsley, K. C., D.C. L,, 

was born at Sussex, Kings County, on X 

September 27, 1850, and was educated oh 

at. the common schools there. He 

graduated with an arts degree from. 

the University of New Brunswick in 

1868. He was a gold medallist in his 

junior year and during his course took 

several scholarships. He stood setond 

in the Gilchrist scholarship competi- 

tion in 1868. He was married on Jan. 

6, 1876, to Fannie, daughter of the late 

Thomas Parks, of St, John. She died 

in May, 1914, and he was married a 

second time to Miss Gertrude Macdon- 

ald, of St. John, in 1915. 

Hea. Mr. Pugsley tas called to the 

bar of New Brunswick on June 27, 

1872, and was reporter in-the Supreme 

Court for ten years. In 1891 he was 

appointed a Q. C. by the Dominion 

government. While a young lawyer, 

he served as reporter of the Legisla- 

ture and afterwards as reporter of the 

Supreme Court. He was first sent to 

the Legislature of New Brunswick in 

July, 1885, on the death of the sitting 

member for Kings, Dr. Vail, and he 

was re-elected and returned at the 

general elections of 1886 and 1890. He 

was Speaker of the House from March 

3, 1887, to May, 1889, when he was 

sworn in as a member of the Execu- 

tive Council and appointed Solicitor 

General. He resigned in 1892. At the 

federal election of 1896 he was an un- 

successful candidate for the House of 

Commons in the city of St. John. He 

was again elected to the Legislature 

in 1899 and accepted the office of At- 

torney &eneral in tae Tweedie minis- 

try on Sept. 1, 1900. “ He was re-elect- 

ed in Kings on Sept. 27, 1900, by a ma- 

jority of 829 and was again returned 

in 1903. On the appointment of Hon. 

L. J. Tweedie to the office of Lieut. 

Governor of New Brunswick in Febru- 

ary, 1907, ‘he succeeded to the prime 

ministry. After the close of the legis- 

lative session he resigned the premier- 

ship and retired from the 

to contest a vacant seat for the city 

and county of St. John in the House 

of Commons rendered vacant by the 

death of Dr. A. A. Stockton, the sitting 

member, having received the unani- 

mous nomination of the Liberal party. 

On August 29, 1907, he was sworn in 

as a member of the Privy Council of 

Canada and assumed the portfolio of 

Minister of Public Works in succes- 

sion to the Hon. Chas. Hyman, resign- 

ed. He retained the office until the re- 

tirement of the Laurier administration 

on October 6, 1911, at the general elec- 

tion of 1911 having been returned for 

his present seat. 

goverament 

oh 
> 

Hon. F. B. Carvell, M. P., struck the 

nail on the head pretty well in his 

speech at Hamilton when he said: “I 

tell you there are men in my province 

wearing thé King’s uniform who never 

left Canada, and who never intend to 

leave Canada, who are drawing enor- 

mous sums from the government in 

salaries and separation allowance, for 

which they give no adequate return. 

Some of these may be necessary, buf 

their places could and should be taken 

» "The khaki-clad 
gentry holding down safety berths, em? 

by returned soldiers. 

ploying batmen at the public expense 

and drawing separation allowances, 

should begin to put their houses in or- 

der. 

oe. 

“Fighting Frank Carvell” seems to 

be making good as Minister of Public y 

Works in the union cabinet. Since 

his acceptance of office he has deliv- 

ered two addresses at political gather- 

ings in Ontario and his plain-spoken 

utterances have elicited favorable 

comment from newspapers of all 

shades of politics. The new Minister 

of Public Works is a plain man of the, 

people, and is undoubtedly a great 

source of strength to the union gov-! 

ernment. 

i ole 2 

Reforms in the Canadian military 

administration are demanded by Cecil 

Creelman, D. S. O., who is an indepen- 

dent candidate on the win-the-war plat 

form in one of the divisions of Mont- 

real. He is reported as saying that 

“our whole military system is perme- 

ated with politics and favoritism, and 

conditions were only temporarily im- 

proved when Sir Sam Hughes was 

forced out. They are worse now than 

ever before.” 
oe. > 

With Hon. F. B. Carvell as Minister 

of Public Works, and Hon. William 

Pugsley as Lieutenant Governor of 

New Brunswick, the people of this 

province must now realize that the 

Union government at Ottawa is a real 

one. : 

The 5 Sth ogee Fras ok 

Guy Fawkes’ was only a bush league 
player. 

Guy couldn't even get his picture on 
the front page these days. 

There is a great deal more to re- 
member now than the gunpowder plot. 

Enthusiasm and blunders are insep- 
arable, 

Every land is a land fof opportunity 
for somebody. 

One way to avoid food waste is to 
keep a few hens. 

5 p 
High food prices should do their 

Christmas dropping early. * 

A man who has cold feet now. hopes’ 
they are also flat. 

Santa Claus already suggests ‘Vic- 
tory bonds for the boys and girls. 

| Apparently Cadorna was “prepared | 

for everything” except a German drive. 

What is your fortune, my pretty 

maid? Just look at the price of milk, 
she said. 

The H,”C. of L. has hit the pancake 
belt—and hitting ‘below the belt, for 
buckwheat is now 8c. a 1b. 

Papatheodorpoumoundurgiolomichal- 

okoupoulos, of Chicago has bought a 
Liberty bond. Next gent! 

If a woman can’t blame her unhap- 
piness on the man she has got, she can 

always blame it on the man she didn’t 
get. 

WANTS INVESTIGATION, 

Toronto, Nov. 3. — “Investigate the 

sugar famine,” demands the World, 

editorially today. “The government,” 

the paper says, “should make an in 

vestigation and then take action. They 

might things about as surprising 

they found in the bacon inqury.” 

as 

SUFFERED 
WITH NERVES 

COULD NOT KEEP QUIET. 

Diseases of the nervous system are 
very common, 

All the organs of the body may be: 
sound while the nerve centres may be| 
affected. 

Many women become run down and 
worn out by household duties never 
ending, and sooner or later find them- 
selves with their nerves shattered and 
the heart action weakened. 
On the first sign of an yweakness of 

either the heart or nerves, flagging 
energy or physical breakdown, do not 
wait until your case becomes hope- 
less. 

Milburn’s Heart and Nerve Pills will 
at once quieten the shaking nerves, 
strengthen the weak heart and build 
up the entire system. 

Mrs. 'F. Bailey, 221 Earl St., Kings- 
ton, Ont., writes: “I was suffering 
very much with my nerves, so much 
so that I could not keep myself quiet 
at all. I was recommended to try Mil-! 
burn’s Heart and Nerve Pills so I 
bought three boxes, and I must say: 
I have derived much benefit from 
them, so much so that my friends have 
all noticed the change in me.” | 

Milburn’s Heart and Nerve Pills are 
50¢ per box at all dealers, or mailed 
direct on receipt of price by The T. 
Milburn Co., Limited, Toronto, Ont. 

SITUATION IN 

= issued a warning to all commercial 

| infected districts, 

NORTHERN MAINE 
I> IMPROVING 

Officially Reported by State 
Health Dept. as Quite Satis= 
factory—N. B. Authori=- 

ties Active. 

Dr. R. H. McGrath, secretary of the 

Provincial Board of Health, this morn- 

ing received from Dr, Young of Augus: 

ta, Me., Director of the Division of 

‘Communicable Diseases, a letter stat- 

ing that after four days’ work in Fort 

field, during which a general and rap: 

id vaccination was resorted to, he is 

‘able to announces that: the ‘smallpox | 

ioutbreak there is under quite satisfac- 

tory control. Secondary cases may de- 

velop but they will be under the obser- 

vaticr and control of an efficient local 

board of health. At Presque Isle ac- 

cording to Dr. Youdg, three cases had 

occurrcd but were under control at 

the a.qe of writing. 

In This Provisca 

In New Brunswick the situation is 

serious but the authorities believe 

they have it in hand. Watch is now 

being kept for secondary cases. At 

Burtt’s ‘Corner one of the suspected 

cases is now considered to be small- 

pox although it is not yet officially re- 

ported. In Fredericton quarantine on 

two persons who had been in contact 

with the disease in Douglas will be 

lifted tomorrow and in a third case a 
few days later. 

Precautions Taken. 

The Provincial Board of Health has 

men and travellers in general to avoid 

Nurses and other 

attendants for smallpox cases are ad- 

vertised for and advice to the public 

is given. It is probable that general 

vaccination will be resorted to if the 

situation does not improve. Mrs. 

Christianson of Marysville has gone 

to Burtt's Corner as nurse. 

FACE COVERED WITH 

PIMPLES 
ASHAMED TO GO QUT 

Many an otherwise beautiful 

attractive face is sadly marred by un- 
sightly pimples, blotches, flesh worms 
and various other blood diseases. 

Their presence is a source of em- 

barrassment to those afflicted as well 
as pain and regret to their friends. 

Many a cheek and brow cast in the 
mould of beauty have been sadly de- 
faced, their attractiveness lost and 
their possessor rendered unhappy for 
years. 
Why then, consent to rest under 

this cloud of embarrassment? 

and 

There is an effectual remedy for all 
these defects. 

It is Burdock Blood Bitters. This 
remedy will drive out all the impuri- 

ties from the blood and leave the com- 
plexion healthy and clear. 

Mrs. Katherine Henry, Port Syd- 
ney, Ont., writes: “Two years ago 
my face was so covered with pimples 
I was ashamed to go out at all. T tried 
several remedies, but they were of nc 
use. At last ‘a friend advised me to try 
Burdock Blood Bitters. I got a bot- 

tle, and by the time it was used I 
could see a difference. I then got two 
more, and when I had used them the 
pimples were completely gone. I can 
h¥hly recommend B. B. B.” 

Manufactured only by The T. Mil 
burn Co., Limited, Toronto, Ont. - 

A Coming Treat. 
“A Forest Travelogue,” by. Robson 

Black at the K. of P, hall Tuesday eve- 
ning, November 6th, at 8 o'clock. Mr. 
Black has very flattering press notices 
from all over Canada where this lec- 
ture has been delivered and he has 
collected a beautiful set of colored 

lantern slides illustrating various 
types of forest and many varied woods 
industries, which will add to the inter- 
est of the lecture. 

Mr. Walter 
in the city. 

THE BRAT 

Everything points to a record at- 
tendance at the Opera House Tuesday 
evening, November 6th, when “The 
Brat” is to be presented. During this 
first trip out of New York, “The Brat” 
has ben doing excellent business, far 

in advance of what was expected, The 
reason is easily seen when the names 

of the cast are read. Such names as 

Rea Martin, Morosco’s own star, Le- 
onora Gnito, Edna M. Holland, talent- 
ed daughter of E. M. Holland, the late 
character actor so well known in Am- 
erica, Burt I. Robinson, who has just 
finished a splendid engagement with 
Jula Dean in “Marie Rose,” Arthur 
Pacie- Ripple, who was last season in 
Klaw and Erlanger’'s “Pollyanna,” Ar- 
thur La Rue and Agnes Lee are sel- 
dom seen in one: cast, 

The story of the play which is by 

Maude Fulton, tells of “the brat,” a 
homeless waif, who is talen from the 
police court by a noveist, who is 
searching for material for his latest 
novel ‘which is not progressing as rap- 

Shaw of Woodstock, 1S 

FURS! 
Childrens Furs. 

Black Fox Stoles 
Black Fox Muffs 

Black Wolf Stoles 
Black Wolf Muffs 
‘Red Fox Stoles 
Red Fox Muffs 

This is the Season for Furs. 

LADIES’ FUR COATS 
in Beaver Hudson and Muskrat 

Our Goods are Right. 

FURS! FURS! 
We have a large stock of Ladies’ and 

Alaska Sabie Stoles 
Alaska Sable Muffs 
White Thibet Stoles 
White Thibet Muffs 
Grey Wolf , Stoles 

‘ ny Wolf ~ Muffs 
Cur Prices are Right. 

John J. Weddall & Son 
Sole Agents for Jaeger” Woolens, “Shamrock Linens,” 

Pictorial Review Patterns. 
“Holeproof Hosiery,” 

Ne 

| 
Save The Unbitnste @ Use All 

Canada Dustless Ash Sifter 

A turn of the handle and ashes sift into barrel. 

Unburned coal drops into scuttle. 

For Stoves and Fuinaces. 

‘Alon stock Coal Hods, Shovels, Ash Barrels etc. 
/ 

WHOLESALE 

B. Chestnut & Es 
THE HARDWARE ey PLE ° RETAIL 

[ 
DOMESTIC, SANITARY AXE sole LAGINEERS. 

a Month. 

You Can Have the DAILY MAIL Delivered at 
Your Home Each Evening for Thirty Five Cents 

_— THE 

MINISTER'S BRIDE 
Will be presented by the Young Peo- 

ple of the Church in the 

METHODIST VESTRY, 

At 8 o‘clock. 

Admission, 25 Cents. 

TCO LATE i FOR CLASSIFICATION, 

WANTED — Nurses, trained and un- 

trained, male and female, to care for 
possible smallpox cases in various 
health destricts. Volunteers commu- 
nicate Immediately with Roy H. Mec- 
Grath, Secretary Provincial Board of 
Health, Fredericton. ’Phone 28, Post 
Office Box 638. 2ings 

\ 

VARIETY SALE. 

The W. C. T. U. will hold a sale 
consisting of quilts, case of birds, use- 
ful and fancy articles, home made 
cooking, etc., in the Edgecombe Build- 
ing York street, November 7th. Pro- 
ceeds for Patirotic Work. 2ins 

Some men are so smart in a busi- 

ness way that people do not care to 

do business with them a second time. 

idly as it should. He takes “the brat” 
to his home that he may study her 
closely. She upsets the prim ant 
proper home by her peculiar ways bu* 

scatters sunshine about, and in re 
forming the younger brother, Stephen 
who has fallen into a life of drunlien 
ness, works out her own salvation, 
life of promise lies before 
1¢ 28 with Stephen for 
Wyoming, 

West rg ‘Phosphoding, 
§) The Great English’ Remedy. 
}) Tones and invigorates the whole 

j nervous system, makes new Blood 
5 in old Veins, Cures RED 

Debit, 1 Dental and Brain Worry, Des 
dency, Joss o, Energy, Palpilation Q, the 
feort, 73k, 1iling Memory. Price $1 per boy, six 

ior §& Usnwill ple ge. wx will cure Sold | by all 
our x BaHES iz 

ret mailed tree. THE Woon 

TUESDAY, NOV. 6TH) 
[AXIDERMIST 

Moose, Deer and Caribou Heads Mounted True to ; 
Life by the best improved methods, at reasonable prices. z 

' Game Feads bought and scold. 

Send for shipping tags and price lists. 

GEO. A. DAVIS 2s, 
Vanceboro, Maine. 

TAXIDERMIST, 
Queen St. Phone 377-31 

Fredericton, N. B. 
= 

p SEBICINE con TORONTO. ONT. (Formerly Windsor.) 

Waists! Waists! 
FOR EVERY LADY—FOR ANY OCCASION. We can show you the 
largest and best selection of dainty and popular priced Waists in the 
City. Try us. 
SILK WAISTS—AII the leading colors ................ $1.25 to $5.00 
CREPE DE CHENE WAISTS inthe leading colors. ..... $3.50 to $7.50 
SHANTUNG SILK WAISTS: a Se nti ah ok ane ee $2.75 
VOLE SWAHSITS sd hE Ed a RB SA TR eR 98c. to $4.50 
POPLIN, .PIQUE and FLANNEL WAISTS ............. $1.25 to $2.00 3 : 
FLANNELETTE :: WASTES! i Sat Sila fri Srp Te sania $1.25 y 

.We have Waists high or low neck, and sizes from 34 to 50 bust. 
See our Special CREPE DE CHENE WAIST at $3.50. 

R. L. B L A C K, AGENT hips lve JERI 


